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Announcement: 

Moody's: Nuclear plant construction poses risks to credit metrics, ratings

New York, June 02, 2008 -- The cost and complexity of building a new nuclear power plant could weaken
the credit metrics of an electric utility and potentially pressure its credit ratings several years into the
project, according to a new report from Moody's Investors Service.

In the report, "New Nuclear Generating Capacity: Potential Credit Implications for U.S. Investor Owned
Utilities," Moody's examines the effects of a new nuclear facility on the credit metrics of "NukeCo," a
hypothetical electric utility. Through this illustrative model, Moody's suggests that a utility that builds a
new nuclear power plant may experience an approximately 25% to 30% deterioration in cash-flow-related
credit metrics. In the case of "NukeCo," cash flow from operations as a percentage of debt falls from
roughly the 25% level to the mid-teens range.

"While new nuclear generating capacity has a number of positive credit implications, it is not without its
risks," said Moody's Vice President Jim Hempstead. "The sheer size, cost and complexity of new nuclear
construction projects can increase the business and operating risk of a utility, potentially exposing it to
downward rating pressure over the intermediate- to longer-term horizon."

According to the illustrative model used in the report, "NukeCo" is well-positioned within the single-A
ratings category before building a nuclear plant and would face little ratings pressure in the early years of
construction. But in years 5-10, when construction costs reach their peak and key credit metrics begin
to deteriorate significantly, the fictional company would be better positioned in the Baa-rating category.

Hempstead said it would be unlikely for near-term ratings or rating outlooks to change solely due to a
utility's decision to pursue new nuclear generating capacity. He said utilities building a new plant would
most likely strengthen their balance sheets and bolster liquidity at the start of the construction cycle.
Further, he said, regulators would be likely to authorize reasonable recovery from ratepayers of
construction costs out of concern for the long-term financial health of the utilities they regulate.

"A utility's approach to its overall corporate financial policies would be a critical factor in the overall credit
profile assessment during the construction period. Our preliminary analysis leads us to conclude that
financial credit metrics will deteriorate meaningfully without significant mitigating factors or other
structural provisions," Hempstead said.

Beyond the financial pressures inherent in nuclear plant construction, Hempstead noted a number of
other risks.

"The technology is very costly and complex, and the 10- to 15-year duration of these construction
projects can expose a utility to material changes in the political, regulatory, economic and commodity
price environments, as well as to new alternatives to nuclear generation," he said. "These potential
changes in the landscape could prompt regulators to disallow certain cost recoveries from ratepayers
after a plant is built, or lead to market intervention or restructuring initiatives by elected officials."

On the side of positive rating implications, Hempstead said new nuclear appears to be one of the most
compelling solutions for electric-power generation amid more stringent environmental regulations --
particularly related to greenhouse gases, which nuclear plants do not emit.

"New nuclear capacity will also provide long-term benefits with respect to fuel diversity, reducing the
reliance on volatile natural gas commodities or purchased-power costs," said Hempstead. "Further, the
longer the time horizon a regulator uses to assess a utility's request to build a new nuclear plant and
recover the investment, the more benefit nuclear power will have on electric rates for end-use
consumers."

* * * * *
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